
AUGUST 3, 2018 BID NO. 102-18
"ELECTRIC MOTOR REPAIR REPLACEMENT"

SANDRA TELLIS
PRINCIPAL BUYER

DESCRIPTION B&D ELECTRIC JASPER ELECTRIC LOUIS ALLIS WARRIOR TRACTOR

SMALL MOTOR REPAIR NO BID ON ANY
 Straight Time (Per Hour) 40.00$                               48.00$                            29.30$                       NO BID 

 Overtime (Per Hour) 80.00$                               63.00$                            43.95$                       NO BID

 Sunday & Holiday Time (Per Hour) 120.00$                             82.00$                            58.60$                       NO BID

Material Markup if applicable (% over cost) 25% 20% 15% NO BID

Yes No Yes NO BID

N/A $48.00/hour N/A NO BID 

Approximate turnaround time for repair Normal - 5 working days 1-2 Weeks 1-2 Weeks

Warranty on repairs Yes 1 Year 2 yrs 

How long in business 44 years 46 years 18 years

LARGE MOTOR REPAIR NO BID ON ANY
Straight Time (Per Hour) N/A 48.00$                            29.30$                       NO BID 

Overtime (Per Hour) N/A 63.00$                            43.95$                       NO BID

Sunday & Holiday Time (Per Hour) N/A 82.00$                            58.60$                       NO BID

Material Markup if applicable (% over cost) N/A 20% 15% NO BID

No Yes NO BID

$48.00/hour N/A NO BID 

Approximate turnaround time for repair N/A 1-2 Weeks 1-2 Weeks NO BID 

Warranty on repairs N/A 1 Year 2 yrs NO BID 

How long in business N/A 46 Years 18 years NO BID 

Delivery is guaranteed no later than __days after receipt of 

order.

Delivery depends greatly 

on availability on parts 

and scope of work. N/A

14 days                      

(Unless work  scope 

is beyond normal 

epair or waiting on 

special parts.)

14 days                      

(Unless work  scope 

is beyond normal 

epair or waiting on 

special parts.)

Do you offer free evaluations?                                                                                                                                                           

If NO, quote your price for evaluation

Do you offer free evaluation?                                                                                                                                                           

If NO, quote your price for evaluation N/A

Prepared by Sandra Tellis 08/2/2018 
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NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND YES YES YES
 NON COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT YES YES YES

EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY CERTIFICATION FORM YES YES YES

 STATE OF COMPLIANCE WITH ALABAMA CODE SECTION YES YES YES
AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR YES YES YES
 SIGNATURE PAGE YES YES YES
PACA COVER SHEET YES YES YES
DEBARMENT STATEMENT YES YES YES
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